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SBI INFRAMANAGEMENTSOLUTIONS PVT. LTD. (SBIIMS) 
                                         (A Wholly Owned Subsidiary of SBI) 

 
Circle Office:4th Floor ,SBI, Local Head Office, III/1,Pt.J N Marg,  

Kharvelnagar,  
   Bhubaneswar-751001 

 
 

 
 

Tender for Civil works of  
SBI Barpali 
(Pricel Bid) 

 
 

Tender ID: BHU201910005 
Date: 11.05.2020 

 
 
 
Name of the Tenderer............................................................................................. 

Address:…............................................................................................................. 

…............................................................................................................................ 

GSTIN:.................................................................................................................. 

(Eligible for doing business at Orissa) 
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SBI-BARPALI 

CIVIL WORKS PRICE BID 
 

S.No ITEM SPECIFICATION QTY UNIT 

1 Flooring Works     

b Providing and fixing 3 mm thick vinyl flooring planks of approved make 
and shade at the first floor 

120.00 Sqm 

2 Aluminium Works for Windows     
a Dismantling doors, windows and clerestory windows (steel or wood) 

shutter including chowkhats, architrave, holdfasts etc. complete and 
stacking within 50 metres lead : Of area 3 sq. metres and below 

10.00 Each 

b 

Providing and fixing aluminium work for doors, windows, ventilators 
and partitions with extruded built up standard tubular sections/ 
appropriate Z sections and other sections of approved make 
conforming to IS: 733 and IS: 1285, fixing with dash fasteners of 
required dia and size, including necessary filling up the gaps at 
junctions, i.e. at top, bottom and sides with required EPDM rubber/ 
neoprene gasket etc. Aluminium sections shall be smooth, rust free, 
straight, mitred and jointed mechanically wherever required including 
cleat angle, Aluminium snap beading for glazing / paneling, C.P. brass / 
stainless steel screws, all complete as per architectural drawings and 
the directions of Engineer-in-charge. (Glazing, paneling and dash 
fasteners  to be paid for separately) : Powder coated aluminium 
(minimum thickness of powder coating 50 micron 

50.00 KG 

c 

Providing and fixing aluminium work for shutters of doors, windows & 
ventilators including providing and fixing hinges/ pivots and making 
provision for fixing of fittings wherever required including the cost of 
EPDM rubber / neoprene gasket required (Fittings shall be paid for 
separately) : Powder coated aluminium (minimum thickness of powder 
coating 50 micron 

50.00 KG 

d 

 Providing and fixing glazing in aluminium door, window, ventilator 
shutters and partitions etc. with EPDM rubber / neoprene gasket etc. 
complete as per the architectural drawings and the directions of 
engineer-in-charge . (Cost of aluminium snap beading shall be paid in 
basic item): :With float glass panes of 5 mm thickness (weight not less 
than 12.50 kg/ sqm) 

20.00 Sqm 

e 

Filling the gap in between aluminium/ stone/ wood frame and adjacent 
RCC/Brick/ Stone/ wood/ Ceramic/ Gypsum work by providing 
weather/structural non sag elastomeric PU sealant over backer rod of 
approved quality as per architectural drawings and direction of 
Engineer-in-charge complete, complying to ASTM C920, DIN 18540F & 
ISO 1160 : Upto 10 mm depth and 10 mm width 

60.00 Meter 

3 Painting Works     

a 

Providing and applying two or more coats of Acrylic Emlusion paint to 
internal walls, columns, beams ceiling etc. Over a coat of primer as per 
manufacturer's specification including all labour and materials 
complete in all floors of approved make and shade. 

1100.00 SQM 
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b 

Providing 2.0 mm thick of Birla white wall care putty (Water resistant 
white cement based putty for concrete mortar walls and ceiling) after 
removing all loosely adhering material from the wall surface of 1 mm 
thickness. 

600.00 Sqm 

c Providing and applying two or more coats enamel paint to door and 
windows, MS works of approved shade and make 400.00 Sqm 

9 

Structural steel work in single section for Window grill, fixed with or 
without connecting plate,including cutting, hoisting, fixing in position 
and applying a priming coat of approved steel primer all complete @ 4 
Kg per Sqft, for Window Ventilator Grill 

1200 KG 

 


